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Abstract 

Pincer nail is a common condition characterized by excessive transverse nail curvature, pro-

gressively pinching the nail bed distally, resulting in cosmetic discomfort, pain and functional 

limitation. Treatment is difficult and often unsatisfactory. Surgical treatment performed by ex-

perienced physicians provides good outcomes. However, patients usually hesitate to undergo 

invasive procedures, preferring conservative treatments. Unfortunately, these mainly offer only 

temporary relief and recurrence rate is high. Topical tazarotene has been used in several nail 

conditions, but its potential remains not fully elucidated. We herewith present a case of pincer 

nails in a 35-year-old woman successfully treated with tazarotene 0.1% gel applied topically 

twice a day for 3 months who did not experience recurrence at 1-year follow-up. At 1-year 

follow-up, no recurrence has been observed. To our knowledge, this is the first case of pincer 

nails successfully treated with tazarotene 0.1% gel. With our report, we suggest topical 

tazarotene as a novel, effective conservative treatment of milder cases of this common, albeit 

disturbing condition. Although our report may not be sufficient to generalize the results, it 

paves the way for larger studies investigating the potential of this fast, noninvasive therapeutic 

agent. © 2020 The Author(s) 
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D
ow

nloaded from
 http://karger.com

/cde/article-pdf/12/2/114/2331953/000507915.pdf by Sapienza U
niversita di R

om
a user on 19 June 2024



 

Case Rep Dermatol 2020;12:114–118 

DOI: 10.1159/000507915 © 2020 The Author(s). Published by S. Karger AG, Basel 
www.karger.com/cde 

Vollono et al.: Tazarotene Gel as a Novel Therapeutic Option for Pincer Nails 

 
 

 

 

115 

Introduction 

Pincer nails is a quite common, mostly acquired condition in which the nails are transver-
sally hypercurved, with their lateral edges traumatizing the lateral folds causing pain [1]. Ex-
act prevalence is difficult to determine as these patients may refer to different professionals, 
such as podiatrists, orthopedics, surgeons, general practitioners, dermatologists, or rely on 
self-medication. 

Although surgical treatment performed by experienced physicians provides satisfying re-
sults, many patients refuse invasive procedures, preferring conservative treatments. How-
ever, no standard method has been established to date, and such treatments seem to offer only 
temporary relief, hence recurrence rate is high. Thus, other therapeutic strategies are neces-
sary. Tazarotene 0.1% formulations have been used with good results in several nail condi-
tions, such as nail psoriasis, onychomycosis, and brittle nail syndrome [2–4]. 

Case Presentation 

A 35-year-old female presented for evaluation of a nail deformity of the left great toenail, 
which appeared many years prior, progressively worsening over time. The patient com-
plained increasing pain and limitation to wearing shoes or walking as the deformity pro-
gressed. She was otherwise healthy and had no family history of a similar lesion. Dermatolog-
ical examination revealed a dystrophic left nail with prominent right axial curvature that 
caused compression of the distal nail bed (Fig. 1a). Radiographic examination was unremark-
able. Routine fungal culture ruled out onychomycosis. Since the patient refused any surgical 
option, conservative treatment using tazarotene 0.1% gel twice a day was prescribed. Five 
months later, a significant reduction of the transverse nail overcurvature and a broadening of 
the nail plate was observed (Fig. 1b). The patient did not complain any adverse events besides 
mild erythema of periungual tissues. She reported significant improvement of her symptoms, 
not requiring further application. At 1-year follow-up, no recurrence was observed.  

Discussion 

Pincer nail is a condition characterized by excessive transverse nail curvature, progres-
sively pinching the nail bed distally. It is quite common in the toenails of adults, while they are 
rare in the fingernails, where they are related to abnormalities of the distal phalanx (exostosis 
or arthritis). The great toes are the most commonly affected [1]. 3 clinical types have been 
identified: (1) the common type (trumpet nail), (2) the tile-shaped nail and (3) the plicated 
nail. In the common type, overcurvature increases along the axis from proximal to distal, 
shrinking in its transverse diameter and pinching the nail bed. The nail plate is markedly thick-
ened, leading to difficulty to cut the nail. Cosmetic discomfort, increasing pain and functional 
limitation urge patients to seek medical attention. Dermatologists, orthopedics, and plastic 
surgeons are usually consulted. Most cases are acquired. Rarely, an underlying tumor such as 
exostosis, implantation cyst, or myxoid pseudocyst may exist, thus X-ray is advisable. The 
pathogenesis seems to be related to deviation and enlargement of the distal phalanx to which 
the matrix is firmly bound by ligament-like collagen with flattening of the adherent nail, re-
sulting in increased distal curvature [1, 5]. Therapeutic approaches vary according to the se-
verity and type of overcurvature, possible risk factors, previous unsuccessful treatment and 
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personal preferences. Surgical nail avulsion has been reported to dramatically worsen the 
condition, thus it is not recommended. Permanent removal of the lateral matrix horns with 
eventual expansion of the pinched nail bed performed by experienced physicians leads to res-
olution of the condition in >80% of the cases [1, 6]. However, only a minority of surgeons owns 
the experience and training required to perform such procedures. Patients usually hesitate to 
undergo surgery, preferring conservative treatments. In mild cases, thinning of the central 
portion of the nail plate may alleviate the pain by increasing the nail plate’s pliability. Nonin-
vasive techniques such as the use of elastic or steel braces (orthonyx) showed good results [7, 
8]. However, about 6–12 months of treatments are required, and a very high rate of recurrence 
is observed. Tazarotene is a synthetic third-generation retinoid deriving from vitamin A. It has 
been used in a variety of dermatological conditions, such as acne or non-melanoma skin tu-
mors. As to nails, it has been used with good results for the treatment of psoriasis, onychomy-
cosis, and brittle nail syndrome [2–4]. Its effectiveness in such conditions probably lies in its 
capability to modulate keratinocytic proliferation, exerted by transactivation of nuclear retin-
oic acid receptors, reduction in the excessive V-Akt murine thymoma viral oncogene homolog 
1 activation-supporting cell growth and reduction of hyperproliferation-associated keratins 6 
and 16 [9–11]. Tazarotene may thus exert its therapeutic effect by normalizing keratinocytic 
proliferation and subsequently limiting acanthosis of the nail bed epithelium responsible for 
the thickened, hard-to-cut nails. The treatment is considered safe and free of adverse events, 
although 1 case of pyogenic granuloma with the use of tazarotene gel for nail psoriasis has 
been reported [12]. Unlike previously published reports regarding conservative treatment of 
pincer nails, our patient achieved significant results after only 3 months, in the absence of 
recurrence at 1-year follow-up. Although our sample is too small to generalize the results, we 
hope our report may pave to way for larger studies investigating the potential of this fast, 
noninvasive therapeutic agent. 
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Fig. 1. a Dystrophic, hypercurved left toenail. b Improvement of signs and symptoms after 5 months of 

treatment. 
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